City of Kenosha WI Tabulation Regarding 16,500 GVWR

 Dump Truck with plow

(Parks Division)

Proposal Notice #04-14

05/05/14

Preparer: mbw

Badger Truck Ewald's Ford Ewald's Ford
Milwaukee, WI. Hartford, WI. Hartford, WI.

Streets & Parks Division
Truck Make/Model/Year 2015 Ford F450 2015 Ford F450 2015 Ford F450

w/ Monroe w/ Casper's
Base Price (Streets) — 3 units $205,041.00 $204,552.00 $196,974.00
Base Price (Parks) — 1 unit $67,335.00 67,152.00 64,609.00
Trade-In Options -$2,300.00 -$9,500.00 -$9,500.00
Total Cost w/o options $270,076.00 $262,204.00 $252,083.00
Option #1 — Extended Powertrain Warranty $3,900.00 $3,470.00 $3,470.00
125,000 miles
Option #2 — Crew Cab $3,400.00 $3,262.00 $3,262.00
Option #3 — Aluminum (5052) Tailgate No Bid $1,056.00 $1,056.00
Option #4 — Tailgate Ctr Mounted Coal Chute $350.75 $368.00 $510.00

$1,424 for aluminum
gate + coal chute

Option #5 —Multi-Position V-Plow $9,000.00 $9,985.00 $5,658.00
Option #6 — Stainless Steel (304) Tailgate Spreader No Bid $8,037.00 $5,787.00
Option #7 — Dump Body Spreader $10,900.00 $10,478.00 $8,039.00
Option #8 — Stainless Steel Conveyor Chain No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option #9- Stainless Steel Top Screen No Bid No Bid $1,109.00

Notes:

Delivery — 150 days

Western/Rowe Equip.

Delivery — 150 days

Delivery — 150 days




	Parks

