BID TABS
PROJECT 13-1413 PETZKE PARK PHASE 2
BID DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

Rasch Construction

Magill Construction

Stuckey Construction

Camosy Construction

Kenosha, WI Elkhorn, WI Waukegan, IL Kenosha, WI
Item Number Base Bid Quantity Unit Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 Mobilization 1 LS $27,872.00 | $27,872.00 | $1,090.00 $1,090.00 | $45,358.80 | $45,358.80 | $48,400.00 | $48,400.00
2 Erosion Control 1 LS $5,672.00 $5,672.00 | $11,390.00 | $11,390.00 | $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,700.00 $5,700.00
3 Tracking Pad 1 LS $2,482.00 $2,482.00 $2,066.00 $2,066.00 $2,187.50 $2,187.50 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
4 Earthwork 1 LS $19,852.00 | $19,852.00 | $32,916.00 | $32,916.00 | $22,700.00 | $22,700.00 | $19,960.00 | $19,960.00
5 Dense Graded Base Course 339 TON $22.123 $7,499.70 $24.00 $8,136.00 $19.50 $6,610.50 $22.25 $7,542.75
6 Concrete 4-Inch Standard (Type 1) 6753 SF $4.129 $27,883.14 $4.59 $30,996.27 $6.20 $41,868.60 $4.90 $33,089.70
7 Concrete 4-Inch Textured (Type 2) 960 SF $5.390 $5,174.40 $6.24 $5,990.40 $10.46 $10,041.60 $8.00 $7,680.00
8 Storm Sewer 12-Inch 525 LF $69.768 $36,628.20 $48.74 $25,588.50 $61.50 $32,287.50 $70.00 $36,750.00
9 Storm Sewer 6-Inch 10 LF $36.869 $368.69 $38.20 $382.00 $32.50 $325.00 $37.00 $370.00
10 PVC Field Inlet 6 EACH $737.371 $4,424.23 $1,526.00 $9,156.00 $650.00 $3,900.00 $740.00 $4,440.00
1 Sanitary Lateral PVC 6-Inch 310 LF $52.183 $16,176.73 $58.50 $18,135.00 $46.00 $14,260.00 $52.50 $16,275.00
12 Clean Out 3 EACH $170.163 $510.49 $516.33 $1,548.99 $150.00 $450.00 $170.00 $510.00
13 Water Service w/Valve 4-Inch 341 LF $38.005 $12,959.71 $57.89 $19,740.49 $33.50 $11,423.50 $39.00 $13,299.00
14 Shelter w/Restrooms 1 LS $254,503.000| $254,503.00 | $282,426.00 | $282,426.00 | $272,216.00 | $272,216.00 | $271,200.00 | $271,200.00
15 Electric Service 1 LS $4,878.000 | $4,878.00 $4,035.00 $4,035.00 $4,300.00 $4,300.00 $4,900.00 $4,900.00
16 Site Lighting 7 EACH $2,847.387 | $19,931.71 | $3,033.86 | $21,237.02 | $2,510.00 | $17,570.00 | $2,870.00 | $20,090.00
17 Restoration 1 LS $18,151.000 | $18,151.00 | $9,352.00 $9,352.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 | $13,550.00 | $13,550.00
Base Bid Subtotal $464,966.98 $484,185.67 $499,499.00 $506,256.45
Item Number Alternate Bid #1 Sidewalk to 29" St Quantity Unit Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1-1 Mobilization 1 LS $4,566.00 $4,566.00 $654.00 $654.00 $7,000.75 $7,000.75 $700.00 $700.00
1-2 Dense Graded Base Course 171 TON $22.124 $3,783.20 $50.15 $8,575.65 $11.50 $1,966.50 $21.00 $3,591.00
1-3 Concrete 4-Inch Standard (Type 1) 3014 SF $3.898 $11,748.57 $4.81 $14,497.34 $6.23 $18,777.22 $4.60 $13,864.40
1-4 Concrete 4-Inch Textured (Type 2) 864 SF $5.552 $4,796.93 $7.73 $6,678.72 $9.93 $8,579.52 $7.40 $6,393.60
1-5 Storm Sewer 12-Inch 50 LF $69.767 $3,488.35 $69.20 $3,460.00 $61.50 $3,075.00 $65.00 $3,250.00
1-6 PVC Field Inlet 1 EACH $737.000 $737.00 $1,526.00 $1,526.00 $650.00 $650.00 $700.00 $700.00
1-7 Trench Drain 7 LF $40.515 $283.61 $490.57 $3,433.99 $181.43 $1,270.01 $265.00 $1,855.00
1-8 Electric Service 1 LS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1-9 Site Lighting 3 EACH $2,847.387 | $8,542.16 $3,241.33 $9,723.99 $2,510.00 $7,530.00 $2,660.00 $7,980.00
1-10 Restoration 1 LS $3,970.000 | $3,970.00 $1,946.00 $1,946.00 $650.00 $650.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00
Alternate Bid #1 Subtotal $41,915.82 $50,495.69 $49,499.00 $42,334.00
Item Number Alternate Bid #2 Splashpad Quantity Unit Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
2-1 Mobilization 1 LS $5,238.000 | $5,238.00 $654.00 $654.00 $23,265.20 | $23,265.20 | $6,940.00 $6,940.00
2-2 Dense Graded Base Course 106 TON $22.121 $2,344.83 $38.75 $4,107.50 $11.50 $1,219.00 $21.00 $2,226.00
2-3 Concrete 4-Inch Standard (Type 1) 1391 SF $8.938 $12,432.76 $5.14 $7,149.74 $6.48 $9,013.68 $7.25 $10,084.75
2-4 Concrete 5-Inch Splash Deck (Type 3) 1018 SF $10.274 $10,458.93 $11.99 $12,205.82 $18.19 $18,517.42 $16.00 $16,288.00
2-5 Storm Sewer 8-Inch 44 LF $89.567 $3,940.95 $42.50 $1,870.00 $78.95 $3,473.80 $84.00 $3,696.00
2-6 Benches 2 EACH $1,020.975 | $2,041.95 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,198.00 $2,396.00 $780.00 $1,560.00
2-7 Electric Service 1 LS $2,184.000 | $2,184.00 $2,742.00 $2,742.00 $1,925.00 $1,925.00 $2,040.00 $2,040.00
2-8 Splashpad Equipment 1 LS $24,653.000 | $24,653.00 | $17,794.00 | $17,794.00 | $25,242.00 | $25,242.00 | $26,760.00 | $26,760.00
2-9 Splashpad Plumbing 1 LS $21,511.000 | $21,511.00 | $20,165.00 | $20,165.00 | $19,558.00 | $19,558.00 | $30,700.00 | $30,700.00
2-10 Restoration 1 LS $3,403.000 | $3,403.00 $1,908.00 $1,908.00 $890.00 $890.00 $3,860.00 $3,860.00
Alternate Bid #2 Subtotal $88,208.41 $70,596.06 $105,500.10 $104,154.75
Item Number Alternate Bid #3 Trees Quantity Unit Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
3-1 Mobilization 1 LS $498.00 $498.00 $327.00 $327.00 $1,599.00 $1,599.00 $600.00 $600.00
3-2 Trees 33 EACH $334.72 $11,045.83 $386.45 $12,752.85 $300.00 $9,900.00 $470.00 $15,510.00
Alternate Bid #3 Subtotal $11,543.83 $13,079.85 $11,499.00 $16,110.00
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