
City of Kenosha WI Tabulation Regarding Carbide Plow Cutting Edges & Curb Guards

07/07/16

Tabulation for Proposal Notice #07-16

Carbide Plow Cutting Edges / Curb Guards (Streets) 

Preparer: MBW

Firm Chemung Supply Corp. Grays, Inc. Ironhawk Industrial Dist. Winter Equip. Co.

 Location Elmira, N.Y. So. Milwaukee, WI. Shippenvale, PA. Willoughby, OH.

Item Item Description Qty

1 Wausau MF-5 Carbide Cutting Edges (30 sets)

Price Per Piece 120 pieces $116.32 $129.00 No Bid $194.97

Total Price $13,958.40 $15,480.00 $23,396.40

Part / Part # Evolution ECBTPRNDA22600 Kennametal 1011922 Winter CB3031031-MF5

2 Wausau MF-5 Cutting Edge Cover Blades (30 sets)

Price Per Piece 120 pieces $18.67 $32.51 No Bid $43.23

Total Price $2,240.40 $3,901.20 $5,187.60

Part / Part # Evolution EPBTPRNDA22600 Esco Bucyrus X120711 Blackcat MF-5 12A

3 Curb Guards (RS) w/ Radius Carbide Weld

Price Per Piece 100 pieces No Bid No Bid $116.69 $120.00

Total Price $11,669.00 $12,000.00

Part / Part # Ironhawk BP126178CRA Winter PC6312IR110

4 Curb Guard (4”) Extensions

Price Per Piece 100 pieces No Bid No Bid $24.00 $24.50

Total Price $2,400.00 $2,450.00

Part / Part # Ironhawk BP58400EXT Winter CE4000

5 Schmidt Wausau PW-9 Patrol Wing Carbide Cutting Edges (30 sets)

Price Per Piece 60 pieces $152.69 $172.00 No Bid $259.96

Total Price $9,161.40 $10,320.00 $15,597.60
Part / Part # Evolution ECBTPRNDA23601 Kennametal 5545777 Winter CB3041531110

6 Schmidt Wausau PW-9 Patrol Wing Cover Blades (30 sets)

Price Per Piece 60 pieces $37.54 $44.62 No Bid $33.58

Total Price $2,252.40 $2,677.20 $2,014.80

Part / Part # Evolution EPBTPRNDA23601 Esco Bucyrus X260126 Blackcat   No Prt. #

7 Monroe Patrol Wing Carbide Cutting Edges 

Price Per Set 8 pieces $190.26 $215.00 No Bid $324.95

Total Price $1,522.08 $1,720.00 $2,599.60

Part / Part # Evolution ECBTPSRNDA22603 Kennametal 5706227 Winter CB3051521-110

8 Monroe Patrol Wing Carbide Cover Blades

Price Per Set 8 pieces $35.04 $55.78 No Bid $41.98

Total Price $280.32 $446.24 $335.84
Part / Part # Evolution EPBTPRNDA22603 Esco Bucyrus X400842 Blackcat   No Prt. #

Grand Total $29,415.00 $34,544.64 $14,069.00 $63,581.84

Bid Notes: No Bid : Item 3 or 4 No Bid : Item 3 or 4 Bid Only: Items 3 and 4 All Items Bid

Manufacturers Literature Included Yes Yes Yes Yes

Warranty Information Included Yes Yes Yes Yes

User List Included Yes Yes Yes Yes

Delivery 30 days 60 days 21 days 21 days (edges), 28 days (bldes)

Payment Terms Net, 30 Net, 30 Net, 30 Net, 30

Other Notes:
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