Tabulation Regarding Type | Barricades/Sheeting / Traffic Cones

No. #03-16 04/21/16 Decker Supply Lightle Enterprises OTW Products, LLC Sherwin Industries, Inc.
MBW Madison, WI. Frankfort, OH. Salt Lake City, UT. Milwaukee, WI.
[ Item | Qty [ Unit Unit Cost | Extended Cost [ Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost | Extended Cost | UnitCost | Extended Cost
| 1.0 | 24 [ EA [Type | Folding Barricades
$46.79 $1,122.96 $41.50 $996.00 $41.39 ‘ $993.36 No Bid
Make/Model Decker (Wood Boards — 5/8” HDO Hiway Safety Hiway Safety
| 20 [ 80 [ EA [Traffic Cone s (427)
$29.75 $2,380.00 $31.25 $2,500.00 $40.32 $3,225.60 $30.25 $2,420.00
Make/Model Plasticade Navicade Corting Plasticade Navicade Lakeside Plastics
| 30 [ 36 | EA |PVC Cones (28”)
$11.30 $406.80 $13.95 $502.20 $12.23 $440.28 $12.12 $436.32
Make/Model Lakeside Plastics Lakeside Plastics 2850-7 Hiway Safety Lakeside Plastics
| 40 [ 24 | EA |PVC Cones (18")
$8.65 $207.60 $9.95 $238.80 $9.49 $227.76 $9.82 $235.68
Lakeside Plastics Lakeside Plastics 1850-3 Traffic Safety Store -single band Lakeside Plastics
[ 50 600 FT |Left Stripe Barricade Sheeting (3”) No Bid $74.25 $297.00 $63.28 $253.12 No Bid
| 6.0 600 FT |Right Stripe Barricade Sheeting (3") No Bid $74.25 $297.00 $63.28 $253.12 No Bid
[ 70 150 FT |Left Stripe Barricade Sheeting (6 “) $175.00 $175.00 $148.50 $148.50 $126.56 $126.56 No Bid
[ 8.0 150 FT [Right Stripe Barricade Sheeting (6 ) $175.00 $175.00 $148.50 $148.50 $126.56 $126.56 No Bid
Delivery 30 days 30 days 30 days 21 days
Payment Terms Net, 30 days Net, 30 days 2%, 10 days, Net 30 Net, 30 days
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